
 

 
Page 1 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

CODE  
 

CITY OF REDMOND 
ORDINANCE NO. 2729 

 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF REDMOND, 
WASHINGTON, AMENDING RMC CHAPTERS 15.04, 
FLOOD CONTROL; 15.08, BUILDINGS AND 
CONSTRUCTION; RMC CHAPTER 15.12, ELECTRICAL 
CODE; RMC CHAPTER 15.14, MECHANICAL CODE; 
RMC 15.16, PLUMBING CODE; RMC 15.18, ENERGY 
CODE, TO UPDATE THE CITY’S BUILDING AND 
CONSTRUCTION CODES TO REFLECT CURRENT STATE 
STANDANDS; AND REPEALING RMC CHAPTER 15.10, 
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, AND RMC CHAPTER 
15.20, VENTILATION AND INDOOR AIR QUALITY 
CODE, IN THEIR ENTIRETY   

              
 

WHEREAS, RCW 19.27.031 mandates that all cities use and 

enforce the State Building Code adopted by the State Building 

Code Council; and 

WHEREAS,  effective July 1, 2013, the State Building Code 

Council has adopted the 2012 Editions of the International 

Building Code, International Residential Code, International 

Mechanical Code, and Uniform Plumbing Code; and 

WHEREAS,  RCW 19.27A.20 mandates that all cities use and 

enforce the current versions of the Washington State Energy Code 

adopted by the State Building Code Council; and 

WHEREAS,  RCW 19.28.010 mandates that all cities use the 

current versions of the National Electrical Code adopted by the 

State of Washington; and  



 

 
Page 2 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

WHEREAS, the Building Code provides a method to address 

unsafe building and structures and the Department of Planning 

and Community Development desires to use Building Code and 

repeal the International Maintenance Code; and 

WHEREAS, the State Building Code Council has repealed the 

Washington State Indoor Air Quality Code and is no longer in 

effect.  

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF REDMOND, 

WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1. Classification.  This ordinance is of a 

general and permanent nature and shall become a part of the City 

Code. 

Section 2.  Amendment of Section.  RMC Chapter 

15.04.060, Flood Control, is hereby amended to read as follows:  

15.04.060 Administration and enforcement. 

 

The Building Official shall administer and implement 

this chapter by granting, granting with conditions, or 

denying building permit applications in accordance 

with its provisions. Administration and enforcement of 

the provisions of this chapter shall be the same as 

provided in the [UNIFORM BUILDING CODE] BUILDING CODE 

as adopted and amended in RMC Chapter 15.08.  



 

 
Page 3 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

Section 3. Amendment of Chapter.  RMC Chapter 15.08, 

Buildings and Construction, is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

Chapter 15.08 

BUILDING CODE* 

Sections: 
15.08.010 Short title. 
15.08.020 Adoption. 
15.08.030 Public inspection. 
15.08.040 Deletions. 
15.08.050 Amendments to the International Building 
Code. 
15.08.060 Amendments to the International Residential 
Code. 
15.08.070 Complete application for permit. 
15.08.080 Penalties for violations. 
 

15.08.010 Short title. 

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute 

the “Building Code” of the City and may be cited as 

such.  

15.08.020 Adoption. 

The International Building Code, [2006] 2012 Edition, 

published by the International Code Council, with the 

additions, deletions and exceptions as set forth in 

Chapter 51-50 of the Washington Administrative Code 

and the International Residential Code, [2006] 2012 

Edition, published by the International Code Council, 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.010
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.020
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.030
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.040
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.060
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.070
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.080


 

 
Page 4 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

with the additions, deletions and exceptions as set 

forth in Chapter 51-51 of the Washington 

Administrative Code, are hereby adopted by this 

reference and incorporated herein as if set forth in 

full as the Building Code for the City, except such 

portions as may be deleted, modified or amended by 

this chapter.  

The Building Official may use the appendices for 

guidance in interpreting and administering the 

Building Code and the provisions of this chapter. 

Further, the following appendix chapters are 

specifically adopted.  

International Building Code: 

Appendix I, Patio Covers.  

International Residential Code: 

Appendix A, Sizing and Capacities 

of Gas Piping; except 

for liquefied 

petroleum gas 

installations;  

Appendix B, Size of Venting 

Systems Serving 



 

 
Page 5 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

Appliances Equipped 

with Draft Hoods, 

Category 1 Appliances 

and Appliances Listed 

for Use and Type B 

Vents;  

Appendix C, Exit Terminals of 

Mechanical Draft and 

Direct-Vent Venting 

Systems;  

Appendix G, Swimming Pools, Spas 

and Hot Tubs; and  

Appendix H, Patio Covers.  

15.08.030 Public inspection. 

The City shall at all times keep on file with the 

City Clerk, for reference by the general public, not 

less than one copy of the codes and resolutions, or 

parts thereof, as herein adopted by reference, 

together with the amendments and supplements thereto 

herein made a part of this chapter.  

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the 

City Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in 



 

 
Page 6 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

order to make them more readily available for 

inspection and use by the general public.  

15.08.040 Deletions. 

The following sections of the International Building 

Code, [2006] 2012 Edition, are hereby deleted:  

1. Section [112] 113 – Board of Appeals. 

2. Section 105.1.1 – Annual Permit. 

3. Section 105.1.2 – Annual Permit Records. 

4. Section 101.4.4 – Property Maintenance. 

The following sections of the International 

Residential Code, [2006] 2012 Edition, are hereby 

deleted:  

1. Section R112 – Board of Appeals. 

2. Chapters 11 and 25 through [42 (WAC 50-51-003)]  

43 (WAC 51-51).  

15.08.050 Amendments to the International Building 

Code. 

The following sections of the International Building 

Code adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to 

read as follows:  

1. Amend Section 101.1, Title. 



 

 
Page 7 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

These regulations shall be known as the “Building Code 

of the City of Redmond,” hereinafter referred to as 

“this code.”  

2. Amend Section 101.4, Referenced Codes. 

The other codes listed in Sections 101.4.1 through 

101.4.6 and referenced elsewhere in this code shall be 

considered part of the requirements of this code to 

the prescribed extent of each such reference.  

[101.4.1 ELECTRICAL. THE PROVISIONS OF THE NATIONAL 

ELECTRICAL CODE AS ADOPTED IN CHAPTER 15.12 RMC SHALL 

APPLY TO THE INSTALLATION OF ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS, 

INCLUDING ALTERATIONS, REPAIRS, REPLACEMENT, 

EQUIPMENT, APPLIANCES, FIXTURES, FITTINGS AND 

APPURTENANCES THERETO.]  

[101.4.2] 101.4.1 Gas. The provisions of the 

International Fuel Gas Code as adopted in Chapter 

15.14 RMC shall apply to the installation of gas 

piping from the point of delivery, gas appliances and 

related accessories as covered in this code. These 

requirements apply to gas piping systems extending 

from the point of delivery to the inlet connections of 

appliances and the installation and operation of 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14


 

 
Page 8 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

residential and commercial gas appliances and related 

accessories.  

[101.4.3] 101.4.2 Mechanical. The provisions of the 

International Mechanical Code as adopted in Chapter 

15.14 RMC shall apply to the installation, alteration, 

repair and replacement of mechanical systems, 

including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings 

and/or appurtenances, including ventilating, heating, 

cooling, air-conditioning and refrigeration systems, 

incinerators and other energy-related systems.  

[101.4.4] 101.4.3 Plumbing. The provisions of the 

Uniform Plumbing Code as adopted in Chapter 15.16 RMC 

shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair 

and replacement of plumbing systems, including 

equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and 

appurtenances, and where connected to a water or 

sewage system and all aspects of a medical gas system. 

The provisions of the State of Washington requirements 

for private sewage disposal shall apply to private 

sewage disposal systems. 

 

 

101.4.4 Property Maintenance is not adopted  

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16


 

 
Page 9 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

[101.4.5 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE. THE PROVISIONS OF THE 

INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE AS ADOPTED IN 

CHAPTER 15.10 RMC SHALL APPLY TO EXISTING STRUCTURES 

AND PREMISES; EQUIPMENT AND FACILITIES; LIGHT, 

VENTILATION, SPACE HEATING, SANITATION, LIFE AND FIRE 

SAFETY HAZARDS, RESPONSIBILITIES OF OWNERS, OPERATORS 

AND OCCUPANTS; AND OCCUPANCY OF EXISTING PREMISES AND 

STRUCTURES.]  

101.4.6 Fire Prevention. The provisions of the 

International Fire Code as adopted in Chapter 15.06 

RMC shall apply to matters affecting or relating to 

structures, processes and premises from the hazard of 

fire and explosion arising from the storage, handling 

or use of structures, materials or devices; from 

conditions hazardous to life, property or public 

welfare in the occupancy of structures or premises; 

and from the construction, extension, repair, 

alteration or removal of fire suppression and alarm 

systems or fire hazards in the structure or on the 

premises from occupancy or operation.  

101.4.7. Energy. The provisions of the Washington 

State Energy Code as adopted in Chapter 15.18 RMC [AND 

THE WASHINGTON STATE VENTILATION AND INDOOR AIR 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1510.html#15.10
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1506.html#15.06
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18


 

 
Page 10 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

QUALITY CODE AS ADOPTED IN CHAPTER 15.20 RMC] shall 

apply to all matters governing the design and 

construction of buildings for energy efficiency.  

3. Amend Section 105.2, Work exempt from permit. 

Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall 

not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to 

be done in any manner in violation of the provisions 

of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this 

jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the 

following:  

Building:  

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as 

tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar uses, 

provided the floor area does not exceed 200 square 

feet (18.58 m²). 

2. Fences not over [6] 7 feet (2,134 mm) high. 

3. Repealed by Ord. 2452. 

4. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1,219 

mm) in height measured from the bottom of the footing 

to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge 

or impounding Class I, II or III-A liquids. 

5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the 

capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons (18,925 L) and 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1520.html#15.20


 

 
Page 11 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

the ratio of height to diameter or width does not 

exceed 2 to 1. 

6. Sidewalks, driveways and detached decks not more 

than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade and not 

over any basement or story below and are not part of 

an accessible route. 

7. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, 

counter tops and similar finish work. 

8. Temporary motion picture, television and theater 

stage sets and scenery. 

9. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group 

R-3 occupancy, as applicable in Section 101.2, which 

are less than 24 inches (610 mm) deep, do not exceed 

5,000 gallons (18,925 L) and are installed entirely 

above ground. 

10. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or 

agricultural purposes and not including service 

systems. 

11. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to 

detached one- and two-family dwellings. 

12. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which 

do not project more than 54 inches (1,372 mm) from the 

exterior wall and do not require additional support of 



 

 
Page 12 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

Group R-3, as applicable in Section 101.2, and Group U 

occupancies. 

13. Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks, 

counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches 

(1,753 mm) in height. 

Electrical:  

Repairs and maintenance: Class A Basic Electrical Work 

as defined in RCW 19.28.006.  

Radio and television transmitting stations: The 

provisions of this code shall not apply to electrical 

equipment used for radio and television transmissions, 

but do apply to equipment and wiring for power supply, 

the installations of towers and antennas.  

Electrical and telecommunications utility companies: 

The provisions of this code shall not apply to 

electrical and telecommunications utility companies as 

specified in RCW 19.28 and WAC 296-46B.  

Gas:  

1. Portable heating appliance. 

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter 

approval of equipment or make such equipment unsafe. 

Mechanical:  

1. Portable heating appliance. 



 

 
Page 13 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

2. Portable ventilation equipment. 

3. Portable cooling unit. 

4. Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any 

heating or cooling equipment regulated by this code. 

5. Replacement of any part which does not alter its 

approval or make it unsafe. 

6. Portable evaporative cooler. 

7. Self-contained refrigeration system containing 10 

pounds (4.54 kg) or less of refrigerant and actuated 

by motors of 1 horsepower (746 W) or less. 

Plumbing:  

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste 

or vent pipe provided, however, that if any concealed 

trap, drain pipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe 

becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove 

and replace the same with new material, such work 

shall be considered as new work and a permit shall be 

obtained and inspection made as provided in this code. 

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks 

in pipes, valves or fixtures, and the removal and 

reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs 

do not involve or require the replacement or 

rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures. 



 

 
Page 14 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

4. Amend Section [108.2], 109.2 Schedule of Permit 

Fees. 

On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical 

and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a 

permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as 

required, in accordance with Redmond Zoning Code 

Section 21.76.030, Application Requirements, as said 

section currently exists or is hereafter amended, 

modified or recodified.  

5. Amend Section [108.4] 109.4, Work Commencing 

Before Permit Issuance. 

Any person who commences any work on a building, 

structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing 

system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be 

subject to a special investigation fee. The 

investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the 

permit fee that would be required by this code if a 

permit were to be issued. An investigation fee, in 

addition to the permit fee, may be collected whether 

or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The 

payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any 

person from compliance with all other provisions of 

this code, nor from any penalty prescribed by law.  



 

 
Page 15 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

[6. AMEND SECTION 108.6, REFUNDS.] 

[APPLICANTS MAY APPLY FOR REFUNDS WHEN AN APPLICATION 

OR PERMIT UNDER THIS CHAPTER IS WITHDRAWN OR CANCELED 

PRIOR TO COMMENCING OF ANY REVIEW OR INSPECTION 

PROCESS. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL DETERMINE WHETHER 

A REFUND IS APPROPRIATE. REFUNDS SHALL BE BASED ON THE 

FOLLOWING:  

1. REFUNDS SHALL BE REQUESTED IN WRITING, ON COMPANY 

LETTERHEAD (IF APPLICABLE), BY THE ORIGINAL APPLICANT 

AND MUST INCLUDE THE PERMIT NUMBER AND THE DATE OF THE 

INITIAL PERMIT APPLICATION. 

2. REFUNDS SHALL ONLY BE ISSUED TO THE COMPANY OR 

PERSON WHO MADE THE ORIGINAL PAYMENT. 

3. 100 PERCENT OF ANY FEE ERRONEOUSLY PAID OR 

COLLECTED SHALL BE REFUNDED, REGARDLESS OF AMOUNT. 

4. NO REFUND SHALL BE MADE ON PERMITS WITH A FEE OF 

LESS THAN $150.00. 

EXCEPTION: FEES ERRONEOUSLY PAID OR COLLECTED.  

5. PERMIT APPLICATIONS REQUIRING PLAN REVIEW THAT ARE 

WITHDRAWN OR CANCELLED BEFORE ANY PLAN REVIEW IS DONE 

MAY HAVE NOT MORE THAN 80 PERCENT OF THE PLAN REVIEW 

FEE REFUNDED. 



 

 
Page 16 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

6. PERMITS THAT HAVE BEEN ISSUED MAY HAVE NOT MORE 

THAN 80 PERCENT OF THE PERMIT FEE REFUNDED IF 

WITHDRAWN OR CANCELLED BEFORE ANY WORK ON THE PROJECT 

HAS BEEN DONE. NOTE THAT NO PORTION OF THE PLAN REVIEW 

FEE SHALL BE REFUNDED ON PERMITS THAT HAVE BEEN 

ISSUED. 

7. NO PORTION OF THE TECHNOLOGY SURCHARGE SHALL BE 

REFUNDED. 

8. NO PORTION OF THE WASHINGTON STATE BUILDING CODE 

FEE SHALL BE REFUNDED. 

9. PERMIT APPLICATIONS OR PERMITS THAT ARE EXPIRED 

SHALL NOT BE REFUNDED.] 

7. [AMEND] Add Section [112] 113, Means of Appeal. 

Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by 

the Building Official related to the application or 

interpretation of this code shall be made pursuant to 

Redmond Zoning Code Section 21.76.060(I), Appeals of 

Type I and II Permits, as said section currently 

exists or is hereafter amended, modified or 

recodified.  

The provisions of this section shall not preclude the 

Building Official from convening a Code Advisory Body 

comprised of members who are qualified by experience 



 

 
Page 17 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

and training to pass on matters pertaining to building 

construction.  

8. Amend Section 116.3 Notice. If an unsafe condition 

is found, the building official shall serve on the 

owner, agent or person in control of the structure as 

provided in RMC Section 15.08.080, Enforcement and 

Penalties.  

 

[8.] 9. Amend Section [115.4] 116.4, Method of 

Service. 

The notice and order and any amended or supplemental 

notice and/or order shall be served [UPON THE RECORD 

OWNER AND POSTED ON THE PROPERTY] as provided in RMC 

Section 15.08.080, Enforcement and Penalties. [THE 

RECORD OWNER FOR THE PURPOSES OF THE PROCEDURES OF 

THIS CHAPTER SHALL BE THE PERSON LISTED IN THE RECORDS 

OF THE KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE FOR THE 

PURPOSES OF MAILING REAL PROPERTY TAX STATEMENTS. THE 

BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL ALSO SERVE ONE COPY ON EACH OF 

THE FOLLOWING, IF KNOWN TO THE BUILDING OFFICIAL OR 

DISCLOSED FROM THE RECORDS OF THE KING COUNTY 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE, INCLUDING THE RECORDS 

MAINTAINED IN RELATION TO THE ONE PERCENT ESTATE 



 

 
Page 18 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

EXCISE SALES TAX: THE HOLDER OF ANY MORTGAGE, DEED OF 

TRUST, LEASEHOLD, CONTRACT PURCHASER OR CONTRACT 

SELLER.  

THE FAILURE OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL TO SERVE ANY 

PERSON REQUIRED HEREIN TO BE SERVED SHALL NOT 

INVALIDATE ANY PROCEEDINGS HEREUNDER AS TO ANY OTHER 

PERSON DULY SERVED OR RELIEVE ANY SUCH PERSON FROM ANY 

DUTY OR OBLIGATION IMPOSED ON HIM BY THE PROVISIONS OF 

THIS SECTION.]  

 [9. ADD NEW SECTION 307.3.1 GROUP H, DIVISION 1, 

OCCUPANCIES PROHIBITED. 

NO GROUP H, DIVISION 1 OCCUPANCIES, AS DEFINED IN 

SECTION 307.3 OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 

SHALL BE PERMITTED.  

EXCEPTION: A GROUP H, DIVISION 1 OCCUPANCY MAY BE 

ALLOWED WHEN OTHERWISE APPROVED BY THE BUILDING 

OFFICIAL AND THE FIRE CHIEF.]  

 [10. ADD THE FOLLOWING ITEM IN SECTION 504, HEIGHT 

MODIFICATIONS. 

504.4 R-1 AND R-2 OCCUPANCIES WITH AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER 

SYSTEMS. WHERE A BUILDING IS EQUIPPED THROUGHOUT WITH 

AN APPROVED AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEM IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH SECTION 903.3.1.1, THE VALUE SPECIFIED IN TABLE 



 

 
Page 19 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

503 FOR MAXIMUM HEIGHT IS INCREASED BY 40 FEET (12,192 

MM) AND THE MAXIMUM NUMBER OF STORIES IS INCREASED BY 

TWO STORIES. THESE INCREASES ARE PERMITTED IN ADDITION 

TO THE AREA INCREASE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 506.2 

AND 506.3. THESE INCREASES MAY BE USED WITH THE 

SPECIAL PROVISIONS IN SECTION 508. THESE INCREASES 

SHALL NOT BE PERMITTED IF THE APPROVED AUTOMATIC 

SPRINKLER SYSTEM HAS BEEN USED TO SUBSTITUTE FOR ONE-

HOUR FIRE RESISTIVE CONSTRUCTION AS ALLOWED IN TABLE 

601, FOOTNOTE E. THESE INCREASES APPLY ONLY TO 

BUILDINGS THAT MEET ALL OF THE FOLLOWING REQUIREMENTS.  

1. THE BUILDING INCLUDES ONLY R-1 AND R-2 OCCUPANCIES 

EXCEPT THAT OCCUPANCIES OTHER THAN R-1 AND R-2 ARE 

PERMITTED IN THE TYPE I S-2 PARKING GARAGE AS ALLOWED 

IN SECTION 509.2, 509.4, AND 509.7. THIS PROVISION 

WOULD NOT PROHIBIT INCIDENTAL USE AREAS AND ACCESSORY 

USE AREAS AS ALLOWED IN SECTION 302.  

2. THE BUILDING IS TYPE VA CONSTRUCTION.  

3. THE BUILDING IS LOCATED IN THE OVERLAKE OR DOWNTOWN 

NEIGHBORHOODS AS IDENTIFIED BY THE BOUNDARIES SHOWN ON 

THE MAP IN FIGURE 504.4.  

4. ONLY TYPE IA AND TYPE IB CONSTRUCTION IS PERMITTED 

FOR S-2 PARKING GARAGES.  



 

 
Page 20 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

5. THE FLOOR CONSTRUCTION INCLUDING SUPPORTING BEAM 

AND JOISTS SHALL HAVE A MINIMUM 1.5 HOUR (90 MINUTE) 

FIRE-RESISTIVE RATING. A HIGHER RATING SHALL BE 

PROVIDED WHEN REQUIRED BY OTHER CODE SECTIONS. THE 

FIRE-RESISTIVE RATING OF STRUCTURAL MEMBERS AND 

ASSEMBLIES REQUIRED IN SECTION 714.1 SUPPORTING THE 

FLOOR CONSTRUCTION SHALL HAVE A MINIMUM ONE HOUR FIRE-

RESISTIVE RATING (60 MINUTES) UNLESS A HIGHER RATING 

IS REQUIRED BY OTHER CODE SECTIONS.  

6. EXIT STAIRWAYS SHALL BE ENCLOSED WITH FIRE BARRIERS 

SEPARATING INTERIOR CONSTRUCTION WITH NOT LESS THAN 

TWO HOUR (120 MINUTE) FIRE-RESISTIVE RATING AS 

OUTLINED IN SECTION 1020. THE EXCEPTIONS IN SECTION 

1024.1 ARE NOT PERMITTED.  

7. CORRIDOR WALLS SHALL MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF 

SECTION 1017 AND SHALL HAVE A MINIMUM ONE HOUR (60 

MINUTE) FIRE-RESISTIVE RATING.  

8. STAIRWAY CONSTRUCTION SHALL MEET THE REQUIREMENTS 

OF SECTION 1009 EXCEPT THAT STAIRWAYS SHALL BE BUILT 

USING NON-COMBUSTIBLE MATERIALS OR FIRE RETARDANT 

TREATED WOOD.  

9. A SEPARATE ZONE BY FLOOR SHALL BE PROVIDED FOR ALL 

OF THE FOLLOWING TYPES OF ALARM-INITIATING DEVICES 



 

 
Page 21 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

WHERE PROVIDED. (SEE SECTION 907.8 AND SECTION 907.9 

OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE) 1. SMOKE DETECTORS, 2. 

SPRINKLER WATER-FLOW DEVICES, 3. MANUAL FIRE ALARM 

BOXES, 4. OTHER APPROVED TYPES OF AUTOMATIC FIRE 

DETECTION DEVICES OR SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS.]  



 

 
Page 22 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

 



 

 
Page 23 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

[11. ADD NEW SECTION 901.2.1, ADDITIONAL FIRE 

PROTECTION SYSTEM REQUIREMENTS. 

REFER TO THE REDMOND FIRE CODE, AS ADOPTED IN CHAPTER 

15.06 OF THE REDMOND MUNICIPAL CODE, FOR ADDITIONAL 

AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM, ALTERNATIVE AUTOMATIC 

FIRE-EXTINGUISHING SYSTEM, STANDPIPE SYSTEM, PORTABLE 

FIRE EXTINGUISHER, FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEM AND 

EMERGENCY ALARM SYSTEM REQUIREMENTS.] 

[12. AMEND SECTION 1011.1, WHERE REQUIRED. 

EXITS AND EXIT ACCESS DOORS SHALL BE MARKED BY AN 

APPROVED EXIT SIGN READILY VISIBLE FROM ANY DIRECTION 

OF EGRESS TRAVEL. ACCESS TO EXITS SHALL BE MARKED BY 

READILY VISIBLE EXIT SIGNS IN CASES WHERE THE EXIT OR 

THE PATH OF EGRESS TRAVEL IS NOT IMMEDIATELY VISIBLE 

TO THE OCCUPANTS. EXIT SIGN PLACEMENT SHALL BE SUCH 

THAT NO POINT IN AN EXIT ACCESS CORRIDOR IS MORE THAN 

100 FEET (30,480 MM) OR THE LISTED VIEWING DISTANCE 

FOR THE SIGN, WHICHEVER IS LESS, FROM THE NEAREST 

VISIBLE EXIT SIGN.  

EXCEPTIONS:  

1. EXIT SIGNS ARE NOT REQUIRED IN ROOMS OR AREAS WHICH 

REQUIRE ONLY ONE EXIT OR EXIT ACCESS, PROVIDED THE 



 

 
Page 24 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

EXIT OR EXIT ACCESS IS CLEARLY IDENTIFIABLE AND IS 

APPROVED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. 

2. MAIN EXTERIOR EXIT DOORS OR GATES WHICH OBVIOUSLY 

AND CLEARLY ARE IDENTIFIABLE AS EXITS NEED NOT HAVE 

EXIT SIGNS WHERE APPROVED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. 

3. EXIT SIGNS ARE NOT REQUIRED IN OCCUPANCIES IN GROUP 

U AND INDIVIDUAL SLEEPING UNITS OR DWELLING UNITS IN 

GROUP R-1, R-2 OR R-3. 

4. EXIT SIGNS ARE NOT REQUIRED IN SLEEPING AREAS IN 

OCCUPANCIES IN GROUP I-3. 

5. IN OCCUPANCIES IN GROUPS A-4 AND A-5, EXIT SIGNS 

ARE NOT REQUIRED ON THE SEATING SIDE OF VOMITORIES OR 

OPENINGS INTO SEATING AREAS WHERE EXIT SIGNS ARE 

PROVIDED IN THE CONCOURSE THAT ARE READILY APPARENT 

FROM THE VOMITORIES. EGRESS LIGHTING IS PROVIDED TO 

IDENTIFY EACH VOMITORY OR OPENING WITHIN THE SEATING 

AREA IN AN EMERGENCY.] 

[13. AMEND SECTION 1011.5.1, GRAPHICS. 

EVERY EXIT SIGN AND DIRECTIONAL EXIT SIGN SHALL HAVE 

PLAINLY LEGIBLE LETTERS NOT LESS THAN 6 INCHES (152 

MM) HIGH WITH THE PRINCIPAL STROKES OF THE LETTERS NOT 

LESS THAN 0.75 INCH (19.1 MM) WIDE. THE WORD “EXIT” 

SHALL HAVE LETTERS HAVING A WIDTH NOT LESS THAN 2 



 

 
Page 25 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

INCHES (51 MM) WIDE EXCEPT THE LETTER “I,” AND THE 

MINIMUM SPACING BETWEEN LETTERS SHALL NOT BE LESS THAN 

0.375 INCH (9.5 MM). SIGNS LARGER THAN THE MINIMUM 

ESTABLISHED IN THIS SECTION SHALL HAVE LETTER WIDTHS, 

STROKES AND SPACING IN PROPORTION TO THEIR HEIGHT.  

THE WORD “EXIT” SHALL BE “GREEN” ON A HIGH CONTRASTING 

BACKGROUND AND SHALL BE CLEARLY DISCERNIBLE WHEN THE 

EXIT SIGN ILLUMINATION MEANS IS OR IS NOT ENERGIZED. 

IF AN ARROW IS PROVIDED AS PART OF THE EXIT SIGN, THE 

CONSTRUCTION SHALL BE SUCH THAT THE ARROW DIRECTION 

CANNOT BE READILY CHANGED.] 

15.08.060 Amendments to the International Residential 

Code. 

The following sections of the International 

Residential Code adopted by this chapter are hereby 

amended to read as follows:  

1. Amend Section R101.1, Title. 

These provisions shall be known as the “Residential 

Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings of the City of 

Redmond,” and shall be cited as such and will be 

referred to as “this code.”  

2. Amend Section R102.4, Referenced codes and 

standards. 



 

 
Page 26 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

The referenced codes and standards shall be as 

specified in Section 101.4 of the amended 

administrative provisions of the International 

Building Code, Section 15.08.050, Redmond Municipal 

Code.  

3. Amend Section R105.2, Work exempt from permit. 

Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall 

not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to 

be done in any manner in violation of the provisions 

of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this 

jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the 

following:  

Building:  

1. One-story detached accessory structures, provided 

the floor area does not exceed 200 square feet (18.58 

m²). 

2. Fences not over [6] 7 feet (2,134 mm) high. 

3. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1,219 

mm) in height measured from the bottom of the footing 

to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge. 

4. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the 

capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons (18,925 L) and 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050


 

 
Page 27 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

the ratio of height to diameter or width does not 

exceed 2 to 1. 

5. Sidewalks, driveways, and detached decks not more 

than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade and not 

over any basement or story below. 

6. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, 

counter tops and similar finish work. 

7. Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 24 

inches (610 mm) deep. 

8. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to 

a one- or two-family dwelling. 

9. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which 

do not project more than 54 inches (1,372 mm) from the 

exterior wall and do not require additional support. 

10. Light weight roof covering. Light weight roof 

covering includes composition, or metal roof covering, 

and similar materials where the installed unit weight 

is less than 4 pounds per square foot. 

11. Removal and replacement of interior doors in 

existing door frames. 

12. Removal and replacement of exterior windows in 

existing window openings. The size of opening may not 



 

 
Page 28 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

be altered and operable opening size may not be 

decreased. 

Electrical:  

Repairs and maintenance: A permit shall not be 

required for Class A Basic Electrical Work as defined 

in RCW 19.28.006.  

Gas:  

1. Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying 

appliances. 

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter 

approval of equipment or make such equipment unsafe. 

3. Portable fuel cell appliances that are not 

connected to a fixed piping system and are not 

interconnected to a power grid. 

Mechanical:  

1. Portable heating appliance. 

2. Portable ventilation equipment. 

3. Portable cooling unit. 

4. Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any 

heating or cooling equipment regulated by this code. 

5. Replacement of any part which does not alter its 

approval or make it unsafe. 

6. Portable evaporative cooler. 



 

 
Page 29 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

7. Self-contained refrigeration system containing 10 

pounds (4.54 kg) or less of refrigerant and actuated 

by motors of 1 horsepower (746 W) or less. 

8. Portable fuel cell appliances that are not 

connected to a fixed piping system and are not 

interconnected to a power grid. 

Plumbing:  

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste 

or vent pipe provided; however, that if any concealed 

trap, drain pipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe 

becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove 

and replace the same with new material, such work 

shall be considered as new work and a permit shall be 

obtained and inspection made as provided in this code. 

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks 

in pipes, valves or fixtures, and the removal and 

reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs 

do not involve or require the replacement or 

rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures. 

4. Amend Section R108.2, Schedule of permit fees. 

On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical 

and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a 

permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as 



 

 
Page 30 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

required, in accordance with the Redmond Zoning Code 

21.76, as said section currently exists or is 

hereafter amended, modified or recodified.  

5. Amend Section R108.5, Refunds. 

The building official shall authorize the refunding of 

fees based on [AMENDED] administrative provision 

[SECTION 108.6] of the International Building Code, 

RMC 15.08[.050].  

6. [ADD NEW] Amend Section R108.6, Work commencing 

before permit issuance. 

Any person who commences any work on a building, 

structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing 

system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be 

subject to a special investigation fee. The 

investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the 

permit fee that would be required by this code if a 

permit were to be issued. An investigation fee, in 

addition to the permit fee, may be collected whether 

or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The 

payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any 

person from compliance with all other provisions of 

this code, nor from any penalty prescribed by law.  

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050


 

 
Page 31 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

7. [AMEND] Add Section R112, [APPEALS] Means of 

Appeal. 

Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by 

the Building Official related to the application or 

interpretation of this code shall be made pursuant to 

Redmond Zoning Code Section 21.76.060(I), Appeals of 

Type I and II Permits, as said section currently 

exists or is hereafter amended, modified or 

recodified.  

8. Add new Section R301.1.4, Automatic Fire Sprinkler 

System Requirements for Townhouses. 

All townhouse buildings with an aggregate area of all 

connected townhouses equaling or exceeding 5,000 

square feet or greater shall comply with the 

requirements of the Redmond Fire Code, as adopted in 

Chapter 15.06 RMC for automatic fire sprinkler 

systems.  

9. Amend Table R301.2(1), Climatic and Geographic 

Design Criteria.  

Ground Snow Load = 15 [PS] psf  

Wind Speed = 85 mph 

Topographic effects = NO  

Seismic Design Category = D2  

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1506.html#15.06


 

 
Page 32 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

Subject to Damage From 

Weathering = Moderate 

Frost Line Depth = 12" 

Termite = Slight to Moderate 

Decay = Slight to Moderate  

Winter Design Temp. = 27 degrees F  

Ice Shield Underlayment Required = No  

Flood Hazards = Joined National Flood Insurance 

Program 1979 

Current Flood Hazard Map - FIRM 1999  

Air Freezing Index = 113  

Mean Annual Temp. = 52 degrees F 

10. Add Section R115 Unsafe Structures and Equipment 

Unsafe structures and equipment are subject to the 

provisions for unsafe structures and equipment as 

provided in RMC 15.08.050, amended Section 116 of the 

International Building Code.   

15.08.070 Complete application for permit. 

Determination of whether a building permit 

application is complete for purposes of administering 

Redmond Zoning Code Chapter 21.76, Review Procedures, 

shall be made by the Building Official and shall be 

based upon the adopted building codes.  



 

 
Page 33 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

15.08.080 [PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS] Enforcement and 

Penalties. 

Any person who violates a provision of this code or 

fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof, 

at the discretion of the Building Official shall be 

subject to the enforcement and penalties provided in 

RMC Chapter 1.14. [ANY PERSON WHO VIOLATES A PROVISION 

OF THIS CODE OR FAILS TO COMPLY WITH ANY OF THE 

REQUIREMENTS THEREOF OR WHO ERECTS, CONSTRUCTS, ALTERS 

OR REPAIRS A BUILDING OR STRUCTURE IN VIOLATION OF THE 

APPROVED CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS OR DIRECTIVE OF THE 

BUILDING OFFICIAL, OR OF A PERMIT OR CERTIFICATE 

ISSUED UNDER THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE, SHALL BE 

SUBJECT TO THE PENALTIES PROVIDED FOR IN RMC 1.01.110 

AND CHAPTER 1.14 RMC, AS SAID SECTION CURRENTLY EXISTS 

OR IS HEREAFTER AMENDED, MODIFIED OR RECODIFIED.]  

Section 4. RMC Chapter 15.10, Property Maintenance 

Code, is hereby repealed in its entirety to read as follows: 

[CHAPTER 15.10 
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE* 
SECTIONS: 
15.10.010 SHORT TITLE. 
15.10.020 ADOPTION. 
15.10.030 PUBLIC INSPECTION. 
15.10.040 DELETIONS. 
15.10.050 AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 
MAINTENANCE CODE. 
15.10.060 PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS.] 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1510.html#15.10.010
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1510.html#15.10.020
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1510.html#15.10.030
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1510.html#15.10.040
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1510.html#15.10.050
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1510.html#15.10.060


 

 
Page 34 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

[15.10.010 SHORT TITLE. 

THIS CHAPTER AND AMENDMENTS HERETO SHALL CONSTITUTE 

THE “PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE” OF THE CITY AND MAY BE 

CITED AS SUCH.]  

[15.10.020 ADOPTION. 

THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, 2006 

EDITION, PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL, 

IS HEREBY ADOPTED BY THIS REFERENCE AND INCORPORATED 

HEREIN AS IF SET FORTH IN FULL AS THE PROPERTY 

MAINTENANCE CODE FOR THE CITY, EXCEPT SUCH PORTIONS AS 

MAY BE DELETED, MODIFIED OR AMENDED BY THIS CHAPTER.]  

[15.10.030 PUBLIC INSPECTION. 

THE CITY SHALL AT ALL TIMES KEEP ON FILE WITH THE CITY 

CLERK, FOR REFERENCE BY THE GENERAL PUBLIC, NOT LESS 

THAN ONE COPY OF THE CODES AND RESOLUTIONS, OR PARTS 

THEREOF, AS HEREIN ADOPTED BY REFERENCE, TOGETHER WITH 

THE AMENDMENTS AND SUPPLEMENTS THERETO HEREIN MADE A 

PART OF THIS CHAPTER.  

THE COPIES OF THE CODES ON FILE MAY BE PLACED BY THE 

CITY CLERK IN THE CUSTODY OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IN 

ORDER TO MAKE THEM MORE READILY AVAILABLE FOR 

INSPECTION AND USE BY THE GENERAL PUBLIC.]  

[15.10.040 DELETIONS. 



 

 
Page 35 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

THE FOLLOWING SECTIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 

MAINTENANCE CODE, 2006 EDITION, ARE HEREBY DELETED:  

1. SECTION 111 – MEANS OF APPEAL. 

2. SECTION 304.14 – INSECT SCREENS.]  

[15.10.050 AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 

MAINTENANCE CODE. 

THE FOLLOWING SECTIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 

MAINTENANCE CODE ADOPTED BY THIS CHAPTER ARE HEREBY 

AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:  

1. AMEND SECTION 101.1, TITLE. 

THESE REGULATIONS SHALL BE KNOWN AS THE “PROPERTY 

MAINTENANCE CODE OF THE CITY OF REDMOND,” HEREINAFTER 

REFERRED TO AS “THIS CODE.”  

2. AMEND SECTION 102.3, APPLICATION OF OTHER CODES. 

REPAIRS, ADDITIONS OR ALTERATIONS TO A STRUCTURE, OR 

CHANGES OF OCCUPANCY, SHALL BE DONE IN ACCORDANCE WITH 

THE PROCEDURES AND PROVISIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL 

BUILDING CODE, CHAPTER 15.08 REDMOND MUNICIPAL CODE. 

NOTHING IN THIS CODE SHALL BE CONSTRUED TO CANCEL, 

MODIFY OR SET ASIDE ANY LAND-USE OR ZONING PROVISION 

OF THE REDMOND ZONING CODE, TITLE 21 REDMOND MUNICIPAL 

CODE. 

3. AMEND SECTION 103.5, FEES. 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond21/Redmond21.html


 

 
Page 36 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

FEES SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH REDMOND ZONING CODE 

SECTION 21.76.030(E), AS SAID SECTION CURRENTLY EXISTS 

OR IS HEREAFTER AMENDED, MODIFIED OR RECODIFIED.  

4. AMEND SECTION 106.3, PROSECUTION OF VIOLATION. 

ANY PERSON FAILING TO COMPLY WITH A NOTICE OF 

VIOLATION OR ORDER SERVED IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 

107 SHALL BE DEEMED GUILTY OF ONE OF THE OFFENSES 

PROVIDED FOR IN SECTION 1.14.060 REDMOND MUNICIPAL 

CODE, AS SAID SECTION CURRENTLY EXISTS OR IS HEREAFTER 

AMENDED, MODIFIED OR RECODIFIED. IF THE NOTICE OF 

VIOLATION IS NOT COMPLIED WITH, THE CODE OFFICIAL 

SHALL INSTITUTE THE APPROPRIATE PROCEEDING AT LAW OR 

IN EQUITY TO RESTRAIN, CORRECT OR ABATE SUCH 

VIOLATION, OR TO REQUIRE THE REMOVAL OR TERMINATION OF 

THE UNLAWFUL OCCUPANCY OF THE STRUCTURE IN VIOLATION 

OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE OR OF THE ORDER OR 

DIRECTION MADE PURSUANT THERETO. ANY ACTION TAKEN BY 

THE AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION ON SUCH PREMISES 

SHALL BE CHARGED AGAINST THE REAL ESTATE UPON WHICH 

THE STRUCTURE IS LOCATED AND SHALL BE A LIEN UPON SUCH 

REAL ESTATE.  

5. AMEND SECTION 107.2, FORM. 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14.060


 

 
Page 37 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

SUCH NOTICE PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 107.1 SHALL BE IN 

ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 1.14.100 REDMOND MUNICIPAL 

CODE, AS SAID SECTION CURRENTLY EXISTS OR IS HEREAFTER 

AMENDED, MODIFIED OR RECODIFIED.  

6. AMEND SECTION 107.3, METHOD OF SERVICE. 

THE NOTICE AND ORDER AND ANY AMENDED OR SUPPLEMENTAL 

NOTICE AND/OR ORDER SHALL BE SERVED UPON THE RECORD 

OWNER AND POSTED ON THE PROPERTY.  

THE RECORD OWNER FOR THE PURPOSES OF THE PROCEDURES OF 

THIS CHAPTER SHALL BE THE PERSON LISTED IN THE RECORDS 

OF THE KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE FOR THE 

PURPOSES OF MAILING REAL PROPERTY TAX STATEMENTS. THE 

BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL ALSO SERVE ONE COPY ON EACH OF 

THE FOLLOWING, IF KNOWN TO THE BUILDING OFFICIAL OR 

DISCLOSED FROM THE RECORDS OF THE KING COUNTY 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE, INCLUDING THE RECORDS 

MAINTAINED IN RELATION TO THE ONE PERCENT ESTATE 

EXCISE SALES TAX: THE HOLDER OF ANY MORTGAGE, DEED OF 

TRUST, LEASEHOLD, CONTRACT PURCHASER OR CONTRACT 

SELLER.  

THE FAILURE OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL TO SERVE ANY 

PERSON REQUIRED HEREIN TO BE SERVED SHALL NOT 

INVALIDATE ANY PROCEEDINGS HEREUNDER AS TO ANY OTHER 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14.100


 

 
Page 38 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

PERSON DULY SERVED OR RELIEVE ANY SUCH PERSON FROM ANY 

DUTY OR OBLIGATION IMPOSED ON HIM BY THE PROVISIONS OF 

THIS SECTION.  

7. AMEND SECTION 109.5, COSTS OF EMERGENCY REPAIRS AND 

DEMOLITION. 

THE CODE OFFICIAL SHALL KEEP AN ITEMIZED ACCOUNT OF 

THE EXPENSES INCURRED BY THE CITY IN THE REPAIR OR 

DEMOLITION OF ANY BUILDING DONE PURSUANT TO THE 

PROVISIONS OF SECTION 109 OR 110 OF THIS CODE. UPON 

THE COMPLETION OF THE WORK OF REPAIR OR DEMOLITION, 

THE CODE OFFICIAL SHALL PREPARE AND FILE WITH THE 

DIRECTOR OF FINANCE A REPORT SPECIFYING THE WORK DONE, 

THE ITEMIZED AND TOTAL COST OF THE WORK DONE, 

INCLUDING AN ADMINISTRATION AND COLLECTION FEE IN THE 

AMOUNT OF $200.00 TO COVER THE COST OF PUBLICATION, 

RECORDING AND SERVICE OF ALL NOTICES AND THE COST 

INCURRED BY THE CITY IN THE COLLECTION OF THE 

ASSESSMENT OR OBLIGATION, A DESCRIPTION OF THE REAL 

PROPERTY UPON WHICH THE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE IS OR 

WAS LOCATED, AND THE NAMES AND ADDRESSES OF THE 

PERSONS ENTITLED TO NOTICE PURSUANT TO SECTION 107.3.  

8. ADD NEW SECTION 109.7, COLLECTION OF ASSESSMENT. 



 

 
Page 39 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

A COPY OF THE ORDINANCE CONFIRMING THE SPECIAL 

ASSESSMENT SHALL BE FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK. A 

CERTIFIED COPY OF SAID ORDINANCE SHALL BE RECORDED 

WITH THE KING COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF ELECTIONS AND 

RECORDS. THE DIRECTOR OF FINANCE OR THEIR DESIGNEE 

UPON RECEIPT OF SAID ORDINANCE SHALL PROCEED TO 

COLLECT THE SPECIAL ASSESSMENT IN THE SAME MANNER AS 

LOCAL IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT ASSESSMENTS, INCLUDING 

INSTALLMENTS THEREOF, ARE COLLECTED; PROVIDED HOWEVER, 

THAT THE 30 DAYS’ PREPAYMENT NOTICE NEED NOT BE 

PUBLISHED BUT SHALL BE MAILED TO THE OWNER OF RECORD.  

9. AMEND SECTION 111, MEANS OF APPEAL. 

APPEALS OF ORDERS, DECISIONS OR DETERMINATIONS MADE BY 

THE CODE OFFICIAL RELATED TO THE APPLICATION OR 

INTERPRETATION OF THIS CODE SHALL BE MADE PURSUANT TO 

REDMOND ZONING CODE SECTION 21.76.060(I), APPEALS OF 

TYPE I AND II PERMITS, AS SAID SECTION CURRENTLY 

EXISTS OR IS HEREAFTER AMENDED, MODIFIED OR 

RECODIFIED.  

10. AMEND SECTION 602.3, HEAT SUPPLY. 

EVERY OWNER AND OPERATOR OF ANY BUILDING WHO RENTS, 

LEASES OR LETS ONE OR MORE DWELLING UNIT, ROOMING 

UNIT, DORMITORY OR GUESTROOM ON TERMS, EITHER 



 

 
Page 40 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

EXPRESSED OR IMPLIED, TO FURNISH HEAT TO THE OCCUPANTS 

THEREOF SHALL SUPPLY HEAT TO MAINTAIN A TEMPERATURE OF 

NOT LESS THAN 68 DEGREES F (20 DEGREES C) IN ALL 

HABITABLE ROOMS, BATHROOMS AND TOILET ROOMS.  

11. AMEND SECTION 602.4, OCCUPIABLE WORK SPACES. 

INDOOR OCCUPIABLE WORK SPACES SHALL BE SUPPLIED WITH 

HEAT TO MAINTAIN A TEMPERATURE OF NOT LESS THAN 65 

DEGREES F (18 DEGREES C) DURING THE PERIOD THE SPACES 

ARE OCCUPIED.  

EXCEPTIONS:  

1. PROCESSING, STORAGE AND OPERATION AREAS THAT 

REQUIRE COOLING OR SPECIAL TEMPERATURE CONDITIONS. 

2. AREAS IN WHICH PERSONS ARE PRIMARILY ENGAGED IN 

VIGOROUS PHYSICAL ACTIVITIES. 

12. AMEND CHAPTER 8, REFERENCED STANDARDS. 

THE REFERENCED CODES SHALL BE AS SPECIFIED IN SECTION 

101.4 OF THE AMENDED ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS OF THE 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, REDMOND MUNICIPAL CODE 

15.08.050.]  

[15.10.060 PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS. 

ANY PERSON WHO VIOLATES A PROVISION OF THIS CODE OR 

FAILS TO COMPLY WITH ANY OF THE REQUIREMENTS THEREOF 

OR WHO ERECTS, CONSTRUCTS, ALTERS OR REPAIRS A 



 

 
Page 41 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

BUILDING OR STRUCTURE IN VIOLATION OF THE APPROVED 

CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS OR DIRECTIVE OF THE CODE 

OFFICIAL, OR OF A PERMIT OR CERTIFICATE ISSUED UNDER 

THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE, SHALL BE SUBJECT TO THE 

PENALTIES PROVIDED FOR IN RMC 1.01.110 AND CHAPTER 

1.14 RMC, AS SAID SECTION CURRENTLY EXISTS OR IS 

HEREAFTER AMENDED, MODIFIED OR RECODIFIED.]  

Section 5. RMC Chapter 15.12, Electrical Code, is 

hereby amended to read as follows: 

Chapter 15.12 

ELECTRICAL CODE* 

Sections: 

15.12.010 Short title. 
15.12.020 Adoption. 
15.12.030 Public inspection. 
15.12.040 Deletions. 
15.12.050 Amendments. 
15.12.060 Penalties for violations. 

15.12.010 Short title. 

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute 

the “Electrical Code” of the City and may be cited as 

such.  

15.12.020 Adoption. 

The National Electrical Code (NFPA 70), [2005] 2008 

Edition and effective July 1, 2014, the 2014 edition, 

published by the National Fire Protection Association, 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.010
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.020
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.030
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.040
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.050
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.060


 

 
Page 42 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

with the additions, deletions and exceptions as set 

forth in Chapter 296-46B WAC is hereby adopted by this 

reference and incorporated herein as if set forth in 

full as the Electrical Code for the City, except such 

portions as may be deleted, modified or amended by 

this chapter.  

The Building Official may use the annexes for 

guidance in interpreting and administering the 

Electrical Code and the provisions of this chapter. 

Further, the following annex chapters are specifically 

adopted:  

Annex A, Product Safety Standards;  

Annex B, Application Information for Ampacity 

Calculation; and  

Annex C, Conduit and Tubing Fill Tables for 

Conductors and Fixture Wires of the Same Size.  

15.12.030 Public inspection. 

The City shall at all times keep on file with the 

City Clerk, for reference by the general public, not 

less than one copy of the codes and resolutions, or 

parts thereof, as herein adopted by reference, 

together with the amendments and supplements thereto 

herein made a part of this chapter.  



 

 
Page 43 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the 

City Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in 

order to make them more readily available for 

inspection and use by the general public.  

15.12.040 Deletions. 

The following sections of the National Electrical 

Code, [2005] 2008 Edition, are hereby deleted:  

1. Article 80 – Administration and Enforcement. 

The following sections of WAC Chapter 296-46B, 

Electrical Safety Standards, Administration and 

Installation, are hereby deleted:  

2. References to fees in [WAC 296-46B-905, 296-46B-

910 and 296-46B-911] WAC 296-46B-906, 296-46B-908, 

296-46B-909, 296-46B-911 and 296-46B-915. 

3. Electrical Board-Appeal Rights and hearings in  

WAC 296-46B-995.  

15.12.050 Amendments. 

The following sections of the National Electrical 

Code adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to 

read as follows:  

1. Add new Section 90.4(A), Administration. 



 

 
Page 44 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

The amended administrative provisions of the 

International Building Code, Section 15.08.050 Redmond 

Municipal Code, shall apply.  

2. Add new Section 90.4(B), Basic Electrical Work. 

The Basic Electrical Work definition and 

classification as specified in RCW 19.28.006.  

3. Add new Section 90.4(C), Inspections. 

The installation, alteration or extension of any 

electrical system, fixtures or components for which an 

Electrical Permit is required by this Code shall be 

subject to inspection by the Building Official and 

such electrical systems, fixtures and components shall 

remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes 

until approved by the Building Official. It shall be 

the duty of the permit applicant to cause the 

electrical systems to remain accessible and exposed 

for inspection purposes. The City shall not be liable 

for any expense entailed in the removal or replacement 

of material required to permit inspection. Electrical 

systems and equipment regulated by the National 

Electrical Code shall not be connected to the energy 

source or energized until authorized by the Building 

Official.  

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050


 

 
Page 45 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

4. Add new Section 90.4(D), Special Inspections. 

The Building Official may require special inspection 

of equipment or wiring methods where the installation 

requires special training, equipment, expertise, 

knowledge, or other such factors. Where such special 

inspection is required, an independent third party 

acceptable to the Building Official shall perform it. 

The special inspection person/agency shall be 

designated and approved prior to beginning the 

installation of wiring or equipment. The Building 

Official prior to the installation being approved 

shall receive a written report from the designated 

special inspection agency indicating that the 

installation conforms to the appropriate Codes and 

standards. All costs for such testing and reporting 

shall be the responsibility of the permit holder.  

5. Add new Section 90.4(E), Unused Conductors. 

Electrical conductors not in use shall be removed 

unless otherwise authorized by the Building Official.  

6. Add new Section 90.4(F), Corrections. 

If, upon inspection, any installation is found not to 

be fully in conformity with this Code, the Building 

Official shall at once forward to the person, firm, or 



 

 
Page 46 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

corporation making the installation a written notice 

stating the defects that have been found to exist. 

Correction of these defects shall be made within 15 

days.  

7. Add new Section 90.4(G), Approval of Violations. 

Approval as a result of an inspection shall not be 

construed to be an approval of a violation of the 

provisions of the National Electrical Code or other 

laws or ordinances of the City. Inspections presuming 

to give authority to violate or cancel provisions of 

the National Electrical Code or other laws or 

ordinances of the City shall not be valid. 

8. Add new Section 210.52(G)(3), Electric Vehicle 

Charging. 

Where an applicant proposes to install a battery 

charging station for electric vehicles in a garage 

serving a one or two-family dwelling, a one-inch, 

trade-size conduit shall be installed and terminated 

in a 4 11/16 x 2 1/8 trade size box. The box shall be 

installed in the wall and be a minimum of two feet 

from the panelboard. The box shall be permanently 

labeled to read “Electric Vehicle Charging Only.” A 

two-pole space shall be dedicated in the panel and 



 

 
Page 47 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

shall be labeled “Electric Vehicle Supply Equipment.” 

Nothing in this section shall be construed as 

mandating that a battery charging station be installed 

in every one and two-family dwelling, provided, that 

in the event the Washington State Electrical Code is 

amended to require such installation, the provisions 

of this section shall become mandatory and shall apply 

to all such installations. 

15.12.060 Penalties for violations. 

Any person who violates a provision of this code or 

fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof 

or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 

building or structure electrical system in violation 

of the approved construction documents or directive of 

the building official, or of a permit or certificate 

issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 

subject to the penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110 

and Chapter 1.14 RMC, as said section currently exists 

or is hereafter amended, modified or recodified.  

Section 6. RMC Chapter 15.14, Mechanical Code, is 

hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14


 

 
Page 48 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

Chapter 15.14 
MECHANICAL CODE* 

Sections: 
15.14.010 Short title. 
15.14.020 Adoption. 
15.14.030 Public inspection. 
15.14.040 Deletions. 
15.14.050 Amendments to the International Mechanical 
Code. 
15.14.060 Amendments to the International Fuel Gas 
Code. 
15.14.070 Penalties for violations. 

15.14.010 Short title. 

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute 

the “Mechanical Code” of the City and may be cited as 

such.  

15.14.020 Adoption. 

The International Mechanical Code, [2006] 2012 

Edition, published by the International Code Council, 

with the additions, deletions and exceptions as set 

forth in Chapter 51-52 WAC and the International Fuel 

Gas Code, [2006] 2012 Edition, published by the 

International Code Council, are hereby adopted by this 

reference and incorporated herein as if set forth in 

full as the Mechanical Code for the City, except such 

portions as may be deleted, modified or amended by 

this chapter.  

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.010
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.020
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.030
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.040
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.050
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.060
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.070


 

 
Page 49 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

The Building Official may use the appendices for 

guidance in interpreting and administering the 

Mechanical Code and the provisions of this chapter. 

Further, the following appendix chapters are 

specifically adopted. 

International Mechanical Code: 

None.  

International Fuel Gas Code: 

Appendix A, Sizing and Capacities 
of Gas Piping; except 
for liquefied 
petroleum gas 
installations;  

Appendix B, Size of Venting 
Systems Serving 
Appliances Equipped 
with Draft Hoods, 
Category 1 Appliances 
and Appliances Listed 
for Use and Type B 
Vents; and  

Appendix C, Exit Terminals of 
Mechanical Draft and 
Direct-Vent Venting 
Systems. 

15.14.030 Public inspection. 

The City shall at all times keep on file with the 

City Clerk, for reference by the general public, not 

less than one copy of the codes and resolutions, or 

parts thereof, as herein adopted by reference, 



 

 
Page 50 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

together with the amendments and supplements thereto 

herein made a part of this chapter.  

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the 

City Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in 

order to make them more readily available for 

inspection and use by the general public.  

15.14.040 Deletions. 

The following sections of the International 

Mechanical Code, [2006] 2012 Edition, are hereby 

deleted:  

1. Section 109 – Means of Appeal. 

The following sections of the International Fuel Gas 

Code, [2006] 2012 Edition, are hereby deleted: 

1. Chapter 1 – Administration.  

15.14.050 Amendments to the International Mechanical 

Code. 

The following sections of the International 

Mechanical Code adopted by this chapter are hereby 

amended to read as follows:  

1. Amend Section 101.1, Title. 

These regulations shall be known as the “Mechanical 

Code of the City of Redmond,” hereinafter referred to 

as “this code.”  



 

 
Page 51 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

2. Amend Section 102.8, Referenced codes and 

standards. 

The referenced codes and standards shall be as 

specified in Section 101.4 of the amended 

administrative provisions of the International 

Building Code, Section 15.08.050 Redmond Municipal 

Code.  

3. Amend Section 106.4.1, Approved construction 

documents.  

When the code official issues a permit where 

construction documents are required, the construction 

documents shall be approved, in writing or by stamp, 

as “Reviewed for Code Compliance.” Such reviewed 

construction documents shall not be changed, modified 

or altered without authorization from the code 

official. Work shall be done in accordance with the 

approved construction documents. One set of 

construction documents so reviewed shall be retained 

by the code official. The other set shall be returned 

to the applicant, shall be kept at the site of work 

and shall be open to inspection by the code official 

or a duly authorized representative. 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050


 

 
Page 52 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

The code official shall have the authority to issue a 

permit for the construction of part of a mechanical 

system before the construction documents for the 

entire system have been submitted or approved, 

provided adequate information and detailed statements 

have been filed complying with all pertinent 

requirements of this code. The holder of such permit 

shall proceed at his or her own risk without assurance 

that the permit for the entire mechanical system will 

be granted.  

4. Amend Section 106.5.2, Fee schedule. 

A fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in 

accordance with the Redmond Zoning Code Section 

21.76.030(E), as said section currently exists or is 

hereafter amended, modified or recodified.  

5. Amend Section 106.5.3, Fee refunds. 

The code official shall authorize the refunding of 

fees based on [AMENDED] administrative provision 

[SECTION 108.6] of the International Building Code, 

[SECTION] Chapter 15.08[.050] Redmond Municipal Code.  

6. Amend Section 108.4, Violation penalties. 

Any person who violates a provision of this code or 

fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050


 

 
Page 53 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 

building or structure mechanical system in violation 

of the approved construction documents or directive of 

the building official, or of a permit or certificate 

issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 

subject to the penalties provided for in Redmond 

Municipal Code 1.01.110 and Chapter 1.14 Redmond 

Municipal Code, as said section currently exists or is 

hereafter amended, modified or recodified.  

7. Amend Section 109, Means of Appeal. 

Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by 

the Building Official related to the application or 

interpretation of this code shall be made pursuant to 

Redmond Zoning Code Section 21.76.060(I), Appeals of 

Type I and II Permits, as said section currently 

exists or is hereafter amended, modified or 

recodified. 

15.14.060 Amendments to the International Fuel Gas 

Code. 

The following sections of the International Fuel Gas 

Code adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to 

read as follows:  

1. Add new Chapter 1, Administration. 



 

 
Page 54 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

The amended administrative provisions of the 

International Mechanical Code, Redmond Municipal Code 

15.14.050, shall apply.  

15.14.070 Penalties for violations. 

Any person who violates a provision of this code or 

fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof 

or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 

building or structure mechanical system in violation 

of the approved construction documents or directive of 

the Building Official, or of a permit or certificate 

issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 

subject to the penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110 

and Chapter 1.14 RMC, as said section currently exists 

or is hereafter amended, modified or recodified.  

Section 7. RMC Chapter 15.16, Plumbing Code, is hereby 

amended to read as follows: 

Chapter 15.16 
PLUMBING CODE* 

Sections: 
15.16.010 Short title. 
15.16.020 Adoption. 
15.16.030 Public inspection. 
15.16.040 Deletions. 
15.16.050 Amendments. 
15.16.060 Penalties for violations. 

15.16.010 Short title. 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.010
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.020
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.030
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.040
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.050
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.060


 

 
Page 55 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute 

the “Plumbing Code” of the City and may be cited as 

such.  

15.16.020 Adoption. 

The Uniform Plumbing Code, [2006] 2012 Edition, [AND 

THE UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE STANDARDS, 2006 EDITION, 

BOTH] published by the International Association of 

Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, together with the 

additions, deletions and exceptions as set forth in 

Chapters 51-56 [AND 51-57 WAC], are hereby adopted by 

this reference and incorporated herein as if set forth 

in full as the Plumbing Code for the City, except such 

portions as may be deleted, modified or amended by 

this chapter.  

The Building Official may use the appendices for 

guidance in interpreting and administering the 

[MECHANICAL] Plumbing Code and the provisions of this 

chapter. Further, the following appendix chapters are 

specifically adopted:  

Appendix A,  Sizing the Water 
Supply System; 

Appendix B,  Explanatory Notes 
on Combination 
Waste and Vent 
Systems; and 



 

 
Page 56 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

Appendix I,  Installation 
Standards.  

15.16.030 Public inspection. 

The City shall at all times keep on file with the 

City Clerk, for reference by the general public, not 

less than one copy of the codes and resolutions, or 

parts thereof, as herein adopted by reference, 

together with the amendments and supplements thereto 

herein made a part of this chapter.  

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the 

City Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in 

order to make them more readily available for 

inspection and use by the general public.  

15.16.040 Deletions. 

The following sections of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 

[2006] 2012 Edition, are hereby deleted:  

1. Section 103.4.2 – Plan Review Fees.  

2. Table 1-1 – Plumbing Permit Fees. 

3. Chapters 12 and 15, plus those requirements of the 

Uniform Plumbing Code relating to venting and 

combustion air of fuel-fired appliances found in 

Chapter 5 and those portions of the code addressing 

building sewers (WAC 51-56-003).  

15.16.050 Amendments. 



 

 
Page 57 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

The following sections of the Uniform Plumbing Code 

adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to read as 

follows:  

1. Amend Section [102.3.2] 102.5, Penalties. 

Any person who violates a provision of this code or 

fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof 

or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 

building or structure plumbing system in violation of 

the approved construction documents or directive of 

the building official, or of a permit or certificate 

issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 

subject to the penalties provided for in Redmond 

Municipal Code 1.01.110 and Chapter 1.14 Redmond 

Municipal Code, as said section currently exists or is 

hereafter amended, modified or recodified.  

2. [ADD NEW] Amend Section [102.4] 102.3, [APPEALS] 

Board of Appeals. 

Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by 

the Building Official related to the application or 

interpretation of this code shall be made pursuant to 

Redmond Zoning Code Section 21.76.060(I), Appeals of 

Type I and II Permits, as said section currently 



 

 
Page 58 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

exists or is hereafter amended, modified or 

recodified.  

3. Amend Section [103.4.1] 103.4, Permit Fees. 

A fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in 

accordance with the Redmond Zoning Code Section 

21.76.030(E), as said chapter currently exists or is 

hereafter amended, modified or recodified.  

4. Amend Section [103.4.5] 103.4.4, Fee Refunds. 

Section 108.6 Refunds of the [AMENDED] administrative 

provisions of the International Building Code, 

[SECTION] Chapter 15.08[.050] Redmond Municipal Code, 

shall apply. 

15.16.060 Penalties for violations. 

Any person who violates a provision of this code or 

fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof 

or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 

building or structure plumbing system in violation of 

the approved construction documents or directive of 

the building official, or of a permit or certificate 

issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 

subject to the penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110 

and Chapter 1.14 RMC, as said section currently exists 

or is hereafter amended, modified or recodified.  

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14


 

 
Page 59 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

Section 8. RMC Chapter 15.18, Energy Code, is hereby 

amended to read as follows: 

 

 

 

Chapter 15.18 

ENERGY CODE* 

Sections: 

15.18.010 Short title. 
15.18.020 Adoption. 
15.18.030 Public inspection. 
15.18.040 Deletions. 
15.18.050 Amendments. 
15.18.060 Penalties for violation. 

15.18.010 Short title. 

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute 

the “Energy Code” of the City and may be cited as 

such.  

15.18.020 Adoption. 

The Washington State Energy Code, [2006] 2012 

version, Chapter 51-11 of the Washington 

Administrative Code, is hereby adopted by this 

reference and incorporated herein as if set forth in 

full as the Energy Code for the City, except such 

portions as may be deleted, modified or amended by 

this chapter.  

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.010
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.020
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.030
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.040
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.050
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.060


 

 
Page 60 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

15.18.030 Public inspection. 

The City shall at all times keep on file with the 

City Clerk, for reference by the general public, not 

less than one copy of the codes and resolutions, or 

parts thereof, as herein adopted by reference, 

together with the amendments and supplements thereto 

herein made a part of this chapter. 

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the 

City Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in 

order to make them more readily available for 

inspection and use by the general public.  

15.18.040 Deletions. 

There are no deletions to the Washington State Energy 

Code.  

15.18.050 Amendments. 

There are no amendments to the Washington State 

Energy Code.  

15.18.060 Penalties for violations. 

Any person who violates a provision of this code or 

fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof 

or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 

building or structure in violation of the approved 

construction documents or directive of the Building 



 

 
Page 61 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

Official, or of a permit or certificate issued under 

the provisions of this code, shall be subject to the 

penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110 and Chapter 

1.14 RMC, as said section currently exists or is 

hereafter amended, modified or recodified.  

Section 9. RMC Chapter 15.20, Ventilation and Indoor 

Air Quality Code, is hereby repealed in its entirety as follows: 

[CHAPTER 15.20 
VENTILATION AND INDOOR AIR QUALITY CODE* 

SECTIONS: 
15.20.010 SHORT TITLE. 
15.20.020 ADOPTION. 
15.20.030 PUBLIC INSPECTION. 
15.20.040 DELETIONS. 
15.20.050 AMENDMENTS. 
15.20.060 PENALTIES FOR VIOLATION. 

15.20.010 SHORT TITLE. 

THIS CHAPTER AND AMENDMENTS HERETO SHALL CONSTITUTE 

THE “VENTILATION AND INDOOR AIR QUALITY CODE” OF THE 

CITY AND MAY BE CITED AS SUCH.  

15.20.020 ADOPTION. 

THE WASHINGTON STATE VENTILATION AND INDOOR AIR 

QUALITY CODE, 2006 VERSION, CHAPTER 51-13 OF THE 

WASHINGTON ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, IS HEREBY ADOPTED BY 

THIS REFERENCE AND INCORPORATED HEREIN AS IF SET FORTH 

IN FULL AS THE VENTILATION AND INDOOR AIR QUALITY CODE 

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1520.html#15.20.010
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1520.html#15.20.020
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1520.html#15.20.030
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1520.html#15.20.040
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1520.html#15.20.050
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond15/Redmond1520.html#15.20.060


 

 
Page 62 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

FOR THE CITY, EXCEPT SUCH PORTIONS AS MAY BE DELETED, 

MODIFIED OR AMENDED BY THIS CHAPTER.  

15.20.030 PUBLIC INSPECTION. 

THE CITY SHALL AT ALL TIMES KEEP ON FILE WITH THE 

CITY CLERK, FOR REFERENCE BY THE GENERAL PUBLIC, NOT 

LESS THAN ONE COPY OF THE CODES AND RESOLUTIONS, OR 

PARTS THEREOF, AS HEREIN ADOPTED BY REFERENCE, 

TOGETHER WITH THE AMENDMENTS AND SUPPLEMENTS THERETO 

HEREIN MADE A PART OF THIS CHAPTER. 

THE COPIES OF THE CODES ON FILE MAY BE PLACED BY THE 

CITY CLERK IN THE CUSTODY OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IN 

ORDER TO MAKE THEM MORE READILY AVAILABLE FOR 

INSPECTION AND USE BY THE GENERAL PUBLIC.  

15.20.040 DELETIONS. 

THERE ARE NO DELETIONS TO THE WASHINGTON STATE 

VENTILATION AND INDOOR AIR QUALITY CODE.  

15.20.050 AMENDMENTS. 

THERE ARE NO AMENDMENTS TO THE WASHINGTON STATE 

VENTILATION AND INDOOR AIR QUALITY CODE.  

15.20.060 PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS. 

ANY PERSON WHO VIOLATES A PROVISION OF THIS CODE OR 

FAILS TO COMPLY WITH ANY OF THE REQUIREMENTS THEREOF 

OR WHO ERECTS, CONSTRUCTS, ALTERS OR REPAIRS A 



 

 
Page 63 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

BUILDING OR STRUCTURE IN VIOLATION OF THE APPROVED 

CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS OR DIRECTIVE OF THE BUILDING 

OFFICIAL, OR OF A PERMIT OR CERTIFICATE ISSUED UNDER 

THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE, SHALL BE SUBJECT TO THE 

PENALTIES PROVIDED FOR IN RMC 1.01.110 AND CHAPTER 

1.14 RMC, AS SAID SECTION CURRENTLY EXISTS OR IS 

HEREAFTER AMENDED, MODIFIED OR RECODIFIED.]  

Section 10. Severability.  If any section, sentence, 

clause or phrase of this ordinance should be held to be invalid 

or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such 

invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity 

or constitutionality of any other section, sentence, clause or 

phrase of this ordinance. 

Section 11.  Effective date. This ordinance shall become 

effective five days after its publication, or publication of a 

summary thereof, in the city’s official newspaper, or as 

otherwise provided by law. 

  

http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
http://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/Municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14


 

 
Page 64 of 64  Ordinance No. 2729 

AM No. 14-034 
 

ADOPTED by the Redmond City Council this 18th day of 

February, 2014.   

    
        CITY OF REDMOND 
 
 
 
             
        JOHN MARCHIONE, MAYOR 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
____________________________________ 
MICHELLE M. HART, MMC, CITY CLERK   (SEAL) 
 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
 
 
       
JAMES HANEY, CITY ATTORNEY 
 
FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK: February 4, 2014 
PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL: February 18, 2014 
SIGNED BY THE MAYOR:  February 24, 2014   
PUBLISHED:    February 24, 2014 
EFFECTIVE DATE:   March 1, 2014 
ORDINANCE NO.  2729 
 
 
 
Yes: Allen, Carson, Flynn, Margeson, Myers, Shutz, Stilin 


	15.04.060 Administration and enforcement.
	Chapter 15.08 BUILDING CODE*
	15.08.010 Short title.
	15.08.020 Adoption.
	15.08.030 Public inspection.
	15.08.040 Deletions.
	15.08.050 Amendments to the International Building Code.
	15.08.060 Amendments to the International Residential Code.
	15.08.070 Complete application for permit.
	15.08.080 [Penalties for violations] Enforcement and Penalties.

	[Chapter 15.10 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE*
	[15.10.010 Short title.
	[15.10.020 Adoption.
	[15.10.030 Public inspection.
	[15.10.040 Deletions.
	[15.10.050 Amendments to the International Property Maintenance Code.
	[15.10.060 Penalties for violations.

	Chapter 15.12 ELECTRICAL CODE*
	15.12.010 Short title.
	15.12.020 Adoption.
	15.12.030 Public inspection.
	15.12.040 Deletions.
	15.12.050 Amendments.
	15.12.060 Penalties for violations.

	Chapter 15.14 MECHANICAL CODE*
	15.14.010 Short title.
	15.14.020 Adoption.
	15.14.030 Public inspection.
	15.14.040 Deletions.
	15.14.050 Amendments to the International Mechanical Code.
	15.14.060 Amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code.
	15.14.070 Penalties for violations.

	Chapter 15.16 PLUMBING CODE*
	15.16.010 Short title.
	15.16.020 Adoption.
	15.16.030 Public inspection.
	15.16.040 Deletions.
	15.16.050 Amendments.
	15.16.060 Penalties for violations.

	Chapter 15.18 ENERGY CODE*
	15.18.010 Short title.
	15.18.020 Adoption.
	15.18.030 Public inspection.
	15.18.040 Deletions.
	15.18.050 Amendments.
	15.18.060 Penalties for violations.

	[Chapter 15.20 VENTILATION AND INDOOR AIR QUALITY CODE*
	15.20.010 Short title.
	15.20.020 Adoption.
	15.20.030 Public inspection.
	15.20.040 Deletions.
	15.20.050 Amendments.
	15.20.060 Penalties for violations.

	FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK: February 4, 2014

